
 

LEGAL NOTICE: 
The Safety Savvy Ltd 

Registered Office: 25 Greenway Gardens, London, United Kingdom, NW9 5AY 

Company Registration Number: 16473135 

Contact Email: contact@thesafetysavvy.com 

Contact Phone: 07442 321986 

1. General Information 

The Safety Savvy Ltd  is a limited company registered in England and Wales. We provide 
high-quality first aid training courses delivered by qualified instructors. 

2. Website Use 

This website is provided for informational purposes related to our first aid training services. By 
accessing and using this website, you agree to comply with and be bound by the following terms 
and conditions of use, which together with our privacy policy, govern The Safety Savvy Ltd's 
relationship with you in relation to this website. If you disagree with any part of these terms and 
conditions, please do not use our website. 

3. Intellectual Property 

All content on this website, including but not limited to text, graphics, logos, images, audio clips, 
video clips, and data compilations, is the property of The Safety Savvy Ltd or its content suppliers 
and is protected by UK and international copyright laws. You may not reproduce, distribute, 
modify, display, perform, publish, or create derivative works from any part of this website without 
our prior written consent. 

4. Accuracy of Information 

While we endeavour to ensure that the information on this website is correct, we do not warrant 
its completeness or accuracy; nor do we commit to ensuring that the website remains available or 
that the material on the website is kept up-to-date. The information on this website is for general 
guidance only and does not constitute professional advice. 

5. Course Information and Bookings 

Information regarding our first aid courses, including content, duration, and pricing, is subject to 
change without notice. All course bookings are subject to our specific Terms and Conditions, 
which are available to download on this website at https://www.thesafetysavvy.com/courses-1/ 
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6. Limitation of Liability 

The Safety Savvy Ltd will not be liable for any loss or damage of any nature, whether direct, 
indirect, or consequential, arising from or in connection with the use of this website or the 
information contained within it. This includes, but is not limited to, loss of profits, business 
interruption, or loss of data. 

7. External Links 

This website may contain links to external websites that are not provided or maintained by or in 
any way affiliated with The Safety Savvy Ltd. We do not guarantee the accuracy, relevance, 
timeliness, or completeness of any information on these external websites. The inclusion of any 
links does not necessarily imply a recommendation or endorse the views expressed within them. 

8. Privacy Policy 

Your privacy is important to us. Please refer to our separate privacy policy, which can be 
downloaded from the bottom of any page of our website for information on how we collect, use, 
and protect your personal data. This can be accessed here at : https://www.thesafetysavvy.com 

 

9. Governing Law and Jurisdiction 

This legal notice and your use of this website shall be governed by and construed in accordance 
with the laws of England and Wales. Any disputes arising in connection with this legal notice or 
the use of this website shall be subject to the exclusive jurisdiction of the courts of England and 
Wales. 

10. Amendments 

We reserve the right to amend this legal notice at any time. Any such amendments will be 
effective immediately upon posting on this website. It is your responsibility to review this legal 
notice regularly to ensure you are aware of any changes. 

Last Updated: 21st June 2025 
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